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DIAL LITES—TONIGHT
5:00—KHJ—"Straight Arrow" to the rescue . . . when

Mesquite Molly is kidnapped following an ambush by
the Cheyenne Indians he and Packy ride to find her
abductors.

7=30—KNX—Whimsical Victor Moore, veteran comedian,
stars as the meek, henpecked husband who finally
rebels in "The Coming of Mr. Stover," an original
fantasy on "Skippy Hollywood Theater."

8:00—KECA—An unusual show from the nation's
Capital stars a V. I. P. cast on tonight's "Amateur
Hour" ... Constitution Hall will ring tonight with Sen-
ators and Congressmen who will offer their special tal-
ents to foster the opening of the 1950 Heart campaign.

8:30—KFI—Henry and Homer throw the business world
into a turmoil when they take jobs in their fathers' of-
fices during their vacation. . . . Both Pas -end up won-
dering if their boys will ever be able to support them-
selves during the "Aldrich Family" broadcast tonight.

9:00—KNX—When a sprung thug doesn't report to his
parole board because he has been kidnapped by other
gangsters things are tough for "The Middle Man." This
is another "FBI" authentic drama.

TELE-TIPS

7:00—KECA—A new series, "The Marshal of Gunsight
Pass," features music and drama of the western style.
. . . Lucky Hayden and the Sons of the Pioneers take
the top parts in this scries.

7:00—KNBH—Al Gannaway will emcee a new program,
"Small Talk," which premieres tonight . . . each week
six small children will take over the show with Al to
guide them.

8:30—KTTV—A snowstorm brings two murderers; to the
home of Peggy Grant and her mother. . . . Hildy John-
son of "Front Page" fame effects a rescue in his dash-
ing style.

9:00—KTSL—Art Carney, the garrulous writer of "The
Silver Swan Safe," has Fran Warren, popular singer,
a? his guest on the "Morey Amsterdam Show" tonight.

9:00—KTLA—"Dawn Express" stars Michael Whalen
and Aru.e Nagel in this film tonight.
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10 A. M.
KLAC—Al Jarvis.
KFI—Schoolcast
KMPC—BUI Ewing.
KECA—Ira Cook.
KHJ-KVOE—News.
KFWB—Peter Potter.
KNX—Big Sister.
KFAC—Accent on

Strings.
KGER—News.

Earl Lee.
KFOX—New*,

Religious.
KTED—News, Har-

monies.

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 2
5:30

KTLA (5)—News,
Music.

KECA (7)—Test
5:45

KNBH (41— News,
Music.

KLAC (13)—News
Conference.

6:00
KNBH (4)—Roundup
KTLA (5)—Cowboy
KECA (7)—Mr. Do

Good.
KTTV (ID—Cowboy

Slim.
KLAC

KTLA
Club

(13)—Film.
6:20
(5)—Telescout

Talk.
KTLA (5)—NewsreeL
KECA (7J— Marshall

of Gunsight Pass.
KTTV (ID—Dave

Willock, Cliff
Arquette.

KLAC (13) Open
House

7:15
KTSL (2)—Lee's Lair
KTLA (5)—Back-

ground for Living.
KLAC (13)—Film.

7:30
KTSL (2)—Stranger

Than Fiction
KNBH (4)—News,

Weather.

Keaton.

of

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 2

5 P. M.
KLAC—Fred Henry.
KFI—Feature Wire.
KMPC, KTED—News
KECA—Green Hornet
KHJ, KVOE—

Straight Arrow.
KFWB—Stu Hamblen
KNX—Disc Jockey.
KFAC—Serenade.
KGER—Sports.
KFOX—Religious.

5:15 P. M.
KLAC—Music.
KMPC—Virgil Pink-

ley.
KGER—Western Mu-

sic.
KFI—News.
KNX—Tom Hanlon.
KTED—Lean Back,

Listen.
5:30 P. M.

KLAC, KMPC—Music
KFI—Casa Cugat.
KHJ, KVOE—B-Bar-B

Riders.
KECA—Sky King.
KNX—diet Huntley.
KFAC—Whoa Bill.
KFOX—News.
KGER—World News.
KTED—El Adobe.

5:45 P. M.
KMPC—Top Tunes.
KNX—News.
KGER—Stamps

Quartet.
KFOX—FishcRster.

6 P. M.
KLAC, KECA—News
KFI—Screen Guild.
KHJ, KVOE—Gabrie:

Heatter.
KFWB, KMPC—

News.
KNX—"Suspense."
KFAC—Music Tour.
KGER—Soul Clinic.
KFOX—News, Time

Out.
KTED—David Rose.

6:15 P. M.
KLAC—Al Jarvis.
KMPC—Bob Kelley.
KFWB—Steve Shoe-

maker.
KHJ, KVOE—News.
KECA—Elmer Davis.
KFOX—Hawaiian

Music.
6.30 P. M.

KFI—Duffy's Tavern.
KMPC—Santa Anita.
KHJ KVOE—Tello

Test
KECA—Modem Ro-

mances.
KFWB—America

Dances.
KNX—Crime Phntog.
KGER—Back to Bible
KFOX—Memory

Room.
KTED—Encores.

6:45 P. M.
KHJ, KVOE—Answer

Man.
7 P. M.

KLAC—News, 570
Club.

KFI—Supper Club.
KMPC—Words and

Music.
KHJ—Crime

Fighters.
KECA—Counterspy,
KNX—Playhouse.
KGER—Family Bible

Hour.
KFOX—Studio,

March Time.
KVOE—Business

Trends. Sports.
KTED—Dick Haymes

7:15 P. M.
KFOX—Melodies.
KVOE—Candles and

Silver.
KTED—Orange Co.

Speaks.
7:30 P. M.

KLAC—Ski Time.
KECA—Date With

Judy.
KFI—Dragnet.
KHJ, KVOE—Red

Ryder.

6:25
KNBH (4)—Gallop-

ing Ghost.
KLAC (13)—Sam Bai-

ter.
6:30

KTLA (5)—Time for
Beany

KECA (7)—Think
Fast.

KLAC (13)—Kern- •
per's Kapers.

6:45
KTSL (2)—Test Pat

tern.
KNBH (4)—Cyclone

Malone
KTLA (5)—Handy

Hints.
KTTV (11)—Play

Time.
7:00

KTSL (2)—Norma
KNBH (4)—Small

Young.

Adventure.
KECA (7)—Lone

Ranger.
KTTV (ID—News-

reel.
KLAC (13)—Grab the

Phone
7:45

KTSL (2)—A Neat
Trick.

KNBH (4)—Ernie
Felice Foursome.

KTTV (ID—Marcel-
lino & Clayton
Show.

7:50

KLAC (13)—Irwin
Allen.

8:30
KTSL (2)—Name

That Song?
KNBH (4)—Martin

Kane, Private Eye.
KECA (7)— Hollywd.

Screen Test.
KTTV (ID—Front

Page.
KLAC (13)—Boxing.

9:00
KTSL (2)—M. Am-

sterdam.
KNBH (4)—Top

Views in Sports.
KTLA (5)—Film,

"Dawn Express."
KECA (7)—On Trial.
KTTV (ID—Task

Force.
9:15

KNBH (4)—Film,
"Law of West."

9:30
KTSL (2)—"Jury

Trials."
KECA <.")—Roller

Derbv.
KTTV (ID—Man

Against Crime.
10:00

KTSL (2)—News, Hi
lites.

KTLA (5)—Yer
Buddy.

8:00
KTSL (2)-Queen

For a Day.
KNBH (4)—Pinky

Lee.
KTLA (5)—Holly-

wood Opportunity.
KECA (7)—Live

Show.
KTTV (ID—Buster

Ole KTTV (ID—News-
reel.

10:15
KTLA (5)—Tele-

forum.
KNBH (4)—News.
KTTV (ID—Ironrite,

Wheeler and
Rourke.

10:30
KLAC (13)—Haw-

thorne Show.
TOMORROW (Friday), FEBRUARY 3

KNX—Skippy Holly,
wood Theater.

KFWB—Sid Ziff.
KGER—Helen Mark-

ham.
KFAC—Echoes and

Encores.
KFOX—Meet Band.
KTED—Carmen

Cavallero.
7:45 P. M.

KFWB—Rosary Hour
KFOX—News.
KTED—Sports.

8 P. M.

I KNX—Club 15.
KFWB—News.

I KTED—June Christy
10 P. M.

KLAC—Don Otis.
KFI—Sam Hayes.
KMPC—Leisure Time
KECA—Reporter.

10:00
KLAC (13)—Joe

Graydon.
11:00

KECA (7)—Test.
KLAC (13)—Mikeroy

1:00
KNBH (4)—Test
KLAC (13)—Jarvis

Show (to 5:45).

KLAC—Sing
Troubles Away.

KMPC—Let's Go
Skiing.

KFI—Light Up Time.
Frost Warnings.

KECA—Amateur Hr.
KHJ, KVOE—Hop-

along Cassidy.
KNX—Lowell

Thomas.
KFWB, KTED—

Music.
KFAC—Concert.
KGER—Bible

Treasury.
KFOX—Music.

8:15 P. M.
KFI—World News.
KMPC—Parade of

Hits.
KGER—Hebrew

Christian.
KNX—Jack Smith.

8.30 P. M.
KFI—Aldrich Fam.
KHJ—Sports.
KNX—Mr. Keen.
KFWB—News.
KFOX—County

Barn Dance.
KGER—Concert Hall.
KVOE—America

Speaks Up.
8:45 P. M.

KECA—Robert
Montgomery.

KFWB—Dave
Ormont.

9 P. M.
KLAC—Songs.
KFT—Father Knows

Best.
KMPC—Hits.
KHJ, KVOE—News.
KECA—Author Meets

Critic.
KNX—FBI.
KFWB—Music.
KFOX—America

Looks Abroad.
KTED—Bob Eberle.

9:15 P. M.
KHJ, KVOE—Fulton

Lewis.
KGER—Income Tax.
KFWB—U. N.
KFOX—News.
KTED—Tex Beneke.

9:30 P. M.
KFI—Tex Williams.
KECA—Blondie.
KHJ, KVOE—Peter

Salem.
KNX—Beulah.
KGER—Brown

Schools.
KFWB—Unity.
KFOX—Rendezvous

Time.
KTED—News.

9:45 P. M.
KFOX—Sports.

KHJ—I Love Mystery
KFWB—Gene
Norman.

KNX—Chet Huntley.
KFAC—Music Cross

Roads.
KGER—The Three

Suns.
KFOX—Radio Club.
KVOE—Frost Warn-

ings. 1480 Club.
CTED—Music Menu.

10:15 P. M.
KLAC—Don Otis.
KFI—Johnny Murray
KECA—Ted Malone.
KHJ—Frank

Edwards.
KNX—"On the Cen-

tury."
KGER—Here's to

Vets.
KFOX—Music.
KVOE—1480 Club.
KTED—Turntable

Time.
10:30 P. M.

KFI—T. Dorsey.
KECA—Dr. F. Bailes.
KHJ—Brand Founda

tion Name.
KNX—Command

Theater.
KGER—News.
KVOE—Frost Warn-

ings.
10:45 P. M.

KLAC—Otis. News.
KGER—Night at

Ranchhouse.
KECA—One for Book

11 P. M.
KLAC—Don Otis.
KFI—News.
KMPC—Esquire Trio,
KECA—News.
XHJ—Erv Victor.
KFWB—Gene

Norman.
KNX—Frank B. Goss
KFAC—Music. •
KFOX—Concert

Master.
KVOE—Frost. Warn-

ings.
KTED—Turntable

Time.
11:15 P. M.

KFI—Morton Downey
KECA—Orch.
KNX—Merry -Go-

Round.
KGER—Night at

Ranchhouse.
11:30 P. M.

KFI—Melodies.
KMPC—Ballroom.
KFOX—News, Pipes

of Melody.
KVOE—I Love Mys-

tery.
11:45 P. M,

KFI—To Vets.
KMPC—News.
KFOX—Melodies.
KNX—You and

Magazines.
KVOE—Orch.
KTED—Moondreams.

12 MIDNIGHT
KLAC—Don Otis.
KFI—Music.
KHJ—Waxody.
KFAC—Music to

Dawn.
KFWB—Music.
KNX—News, Steve
Allen.

3:00—Report to Mrs.
Amer.

3:15—Adventure at
Home.

3:45—Your Garden.
4:00—Stu Wilson
Show.

5:00—Frank Webb.
5:15—Lynwood Spot-

lite
5:30—News.

Following same as
daily schedule:

KFI—105.9 Meg.
KECA—95.5 Meg.

Same as daily
schedule f r o m

5:30 a. m. to 12.
KNX—93.1 Meg.

2:00
KTTV (ID—Test
KFI 19) —
9:00—Bill Welsh

12:00—Ladies' Day.
1:00—Cook's Corner.
1:15—Mailbag.
1:40—Johnny
Murray.

2:00—Helpfully
Yours

FREQUENCY MODULATION
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 2

6:10—Music. KUSC—91.5 Meg.
7:00—Frank Ed- I Tomorrow—Friday,

wards. i _ . -
7:30—Kamsler.

8:30—Relig. Report.
9:00—Library

Concert.
10:00—News, Sym-

phony.
Same as daily
schedule f r o m

3:00 to 9:30 p. m.
KMPC—100.3 Meg.

S a m e as d a i l y
schedule f r o m

3:00 to 12.
KHJ—101.1 Meg.

1:30—Norma
Young.

2:00—Farm Fare.
2:30-9:00—Same as

daily schedule.
KKLA—97.1 Meg.

5:00—In the
Groove.

5:30—Sprts.
6:00—Concert
7:30—'Round

Town.
8 :OO—Concert.
9:00—Memories.

KMGM—98.7 Meg.
5:00—:Music.
6:00—Music.
7:00—Concert.
9:00—Broadway

Lullaby.
9:30—Orch.

KFMV—94.7 Meg.
5:00—Child's

Corner.
6:00—Will Allen.

KNOB—103.1 Meg.
5:00—Western
Music.

5:30—Music for You.
6:00—Music.
7:00—L. B. Police

Dept.
7:15—Sammy Kave.

| 7:30—Show Tunes.
8:00—Cowboy
Troubador.
8:15—Army Band.
8:30—Ed Shaugh-
nessy.
9:00—Sports.
9:45—You Pick
Music.
9:55—Sports
Roundup.
10:00—Orch.

KFAC—104.3 Meg.
Same as daily sched

dule. 24 hour.
| KUSC—91.5 Meg.

5:00—Comments.
5:15—Junior Play-

room.
6:00—Today in L.A.
6:15—Beyond Song.
7:00—Concert.
8:00—You A Diplo-
mat.
8:30—Opera.

10:45—U. N.

Feb. 2.
9:00—News.
9:30—Story of

Music.
10:30—News.
10:45—U. N.

11:00—Beyond Song.
11:30—Thru Look-

ing Glass.
1:00—Music.
3:15—Inside Basket-

ball.
4:00—London
Time.

4:30—Melody Time.
KNOB—103.1 Meg.

3:00—Marine Air
Reserve.

3:15—Piano.
3:30—Records.
4:00—Listen to
Stars.

KLON—88.1 Meg.
(Voice' of L. Beach
Public Schools).

9:00 a. m.—What's
In a Name?

9:15—Music Far
and Near.

9:30—Young Musi-
cians.

9:45—Bag o' Tales.
1:00—Young Musi-

cians.
1:15—Camp Hi Hill.
1:30—Great Ameri-

cans.
2:30—Adventures in

Research.

10:15 A. M.
KHJ-KVOE—Gospel

Singer.
KGER—Tom Baird.
KNX—Ma Perkins.
KFOX—Religious.

10:30 A. M.
KLAC—Honest Opin

ion. .
KFI—News.
KHJ—Ladies Fair.
KECA—True Story.
KNX—Dr. Malone.
KFOX—Music.
KGER—Rev. Mark-

ham.
KVOE—Meet the

Band.
10:45 A. M.

KFI—Life Beautiful
KFAC—Music
KGER—Rev. Le Roy

Kopp.
KFOX—Anne Jones.
KVOE—Melodies.

11 A. M.
KLAC—Al Jarvis.
KFI—Double or

Nothing.
KMPC—Bill Ewing.
KECA—Betty

Crocker.
KHJ, KVOE—Ladies

First.
KFWB—Peter Potter.
KNX—2nd Mrs. Bur-

ton.
KFAC—Piano.
KFOX—Rhythmic

Age.
KTED—Organ, Lei-

bert
11:15 A. M.

KECA—V. H. Lind-
lahr.

KGER—Pop. Concert.
KNX—Perry Mason.
KFAC—Books That

Live.
11:30 A. M.

KFI—Today's
Children.

KHJ-KVOE—Queen
for a Day.

KECA—Ira Cook.
KFOX—News, Hit

Tunes.
KGER—Victor

Young.
KNX—Nora Drake.
KTED—Concert Hall.

11:45 A. M.
KFI—Light of World,
KGER—Stamp's

Quartet
KNX—Brighter Day.

12 NOON
KLAC—Al Jarvis.
KFI—Farm Reporter.
KMPC—Music.
KECA, KTED—

News.
KHJ-KVOE—News.
KFWB—Bill Anson.
KNX—Knox Man-

ning.
KFOX—Tunes, Time

Out
KFAC—Concert
KGER—Songs.

12:15 P. Mf.
KFI—Road of Life.
KMPC—News.
KHJ—About .Town.
KECA—Smith Sings.
KGER—World News.
KFOX-News.
KVOE—Farm Forum. I
KTED—Dance
Parade.

12:30 P. M.
KFI—Pepper Young.
KMPC—For Farm-

ers.
KECA—Ira Cook.
KHJ—Mus;c by Mor-

gan.
KNX—House Party.
KFWB—News.
KGER—Serenade.
KFOX—Pacific

Breezes.
KVOE—Music You

Want
12:45 P. M.

KFI—Happiness
Right

KMPC—Song Stars.
KFWB—BUI Anson.
KFAC—News.
KTED—Man on
Street

1 P. M.
KLAC—News. Sports.
KFI—Backstage Wife.
KECA—Fran Scully.
KHJ—Lynn & Holly-

wood.
KMPC—Cal.

Carousel
KFWB—Bill Anson.
KNX—Nona.
KFOX—Texas Tiny

(to 3).
KFAC—Salvation

Army.
KVOE—Tell Neigh-

bor.
KGER—Serenade.
KTED—Mythical

Cruise.
1:15 P. M.

KLAC—570 Club.
KFI—Stella Dallas.
<HJ—Nancy Dixon.
KNX—Harry Babbitt
KFAC—Friends With

Music.
KVOE—Harvey

Harding.
1:30 P. M.

KFI—Lorenzo Jones.
KMPC—Hal Berger.
KHJ—Norma Young.
KECA—Easy Aces.
KNX—Geo. Fisher.
KGER—Clark

Sparks Show.
KVOE—Cedric

Foster.
1:45 P. M.

KFI—Widder Brown
KECA—Baukage

Talks.
KGER—Hawaiian

Music.
KVOE—Civic.

2 P. M.

KLAC— 570 Club.
KFI— Portia Faces

Life.
KNX— Steve Allen.

2:30 P. M.
KFI— Plain Bill
KECA— Hannibal

Cobb.
KGER— Garden •

School, Popular
Music.

KVOE— Here's
Music.

KTED — Concert by
Sea.

2:45 P. M.
KFI— Front Page

Farrell
KNX— Art Godfrey.

3:00 P. M.
KLAC— News Spts.
KFI— Welcome

Travelers.
KMPC — Serenade.
KECA— Bride and

Groom.
KFWB— Maurice

Hart
KFAC — Opera.
KVOE— Mercy Er-

rand.

Paul Douglas Seeks Radio
Roles; Veep, Wife on Big
Heart Fund Show Tonight

By C. E. BUTTERFIELD

NEW YORK. (AP) Paul Douglas, who switched from
sports and studio announcing to the stage and later

the movies, has been dickering with N. B. C. about getting
back into radio as an actor.

On its part, N. B. C. reports it has been looking for the
right kind of a drama series to fit the Douglas characteriza-
tion. Teaming with him would be Judy Holliday, \vho was
on the stage and in the movies with him.

I N. B. C. also has been working *•
ion its Monday night television M . skulnik famed Yiddish
(schedule and looking for suitable'

. :_, ._ *:u ;„ ,u~ «!««.....».*>j material to fill in the alternate
weeks when the new Robert
Montgomery drama is off the
air. One of the two open nights a works:
month will be taken up

Due tonight on three net-
A. B. C. 9—Special Ted

with Mack amateur show on bohaU of
. , . . - . , 1930 Heart Fund campaiRn, Vice

jpfanned * ' President and Mrs. Barklcy.
The other open spot is planned «

KGER— News, Fiesta. as an "Audition on the Air" in eminent
quartets, impersonations, songs

KFOX—News, Music whi£n varjous television possibili-'and other acts; television version
3:15 f. M. ities are to be tried. On Feb. 20 it to be presented next Tuesday

KLAC—News, Spts.
KFI—A Girl Marries
KMPC—Music in Air
KECA—Surprise

Package.
KHJ—Club 930.
KFWB—Bill Anson.
KFAC—Malinee.
KGER—Popular

Music.
KVOE—Here's Music
KTED—News,

Riviera Time.
2:15 P. M.

KLAC—Don Otis.
KVOE—Meet Friend.:

3:30 P. M.
KFI—Aunt Mary.
KFOX—Everybody's

Business.
KECA—Pick a Date.
KFWB—News,
KFAC—Lyrics.
KVOE—Platter

Parade.
KTED—Teen Time.

3:45 P. M.
KFI—Love and

Learn.
KFWB—Maurice

Hart.
KFAC—News.
KGER—News (3:55).
KFOX—Pension.
KVOE—Andre Kos-

telanetz.
4 P. M.

KFI— Woman's
Secret

KLAC—News, Spts.
KMPC—News.
KECA—Art Baker.
KHJ, KVOE—Fulton

Lewis Jr.
KNX—Curt Masscy.
KFAC—Music.

Rancho 1390.
KFOX—News, Dr.

Harrod.
KTED—Teen Time.

4:15 P. M.
KLAC—Melodies.
KFI—Dr. Paul.
KMPC—Songs.
KHJ, KVOE—News.
KFWB—Dave

Ormont.
KNX—Stand in.
KGER—Rancho 1390.
KFOX—Freddie

Martin.
4:30 P. M.

KLAC—Music.
KFI—B. Wheeler.
KMPC—Roddy Me-

Dowall.
KHJ—Behind the

Story.
KECA—Records.
KFWB—Red Rowe.

be a show built around nipht on N. B. C.-TV.

Root Vegetable

HORIZONTAL !
1 Depicted

vegetable '
711 grows in

13 Interstice '
14 Adduce
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convulsively
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9 Right line
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18 At this time luunvnaum •
19AppeizerT H Self esteem 26 Tests 43 Clock face
21 Hodgepodge 1? Novel 27 Biblical 44 Facility
24 Official acts 17 Rough lava mountain « Liter
"8 Cushions 19 Lettuce 35 French plural 46 Before
29 Youne salmon 20 Tree fluid article 4" Entire
in Prioritv 2 1 Oppugn 36 Courtesy title 49 Footlike part

(prefix) 22 Pantry 40 Fabric made 50 Mineral rock
•H Narrow inlet 23 Standards of from cotton 51 Onager
32 Harem room perfection 41 Afresh f 3 Not (pref.x)
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hearing 1)ver. as a sh'P niton tantalum
34 Vend
36 Biblical name
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(ab.)
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grasses
52 Feminine

name
54 Flowers
56 It is or

orange-red
'57 Rents

VERTICAL
1 Eccentric
.wheel

2 Exist
3 Rot by
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moisture "
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language
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KNX— Dr.'s Office.
KFOX— Music.
KVOE— Behind the

Story.
4.45 P. M.

KLAC— Race Rour
up.

KNX— Ed R.
Murrow.

KECA— Happy Th
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d- KHJ, KVOE— News.
KFWB— Stuart

Hamblen.
KGER— Studio

;a. (4:55).

DAWN TO 7 A. H.
KLAC—Haynes at

Reins.
KMPC—Religious,

Music, Farm
KECA—News. Music.
KFI—News. Music.
KHJ—Rise and Shine
KFWB—Bill Leyden.
KNX—News, Music
KFAC—Coffee

Concert
KGER—John Brown

Schools' Program
(5:0n to 6:00).
Stars sing Soui
Patrol (6:25).

KFOX—Texas
Tiny (6:30).

KVOE—Mexican
Hour.

7 A. M.
KLAC—Haynes.
KFI, KFOX—News.
KMPC—Farm

Advisor.
KECA—Welcome To

Hollywood.
KHJ, KVOE—News.
KFWB—Bill Leyden.
KNX—Nelson

Pringle.
KGER—Religious.
KTED—Breakfast

With Branson.

7:15 A. M.
KFI—Lawton.
KMPC—News.
KHJ, KVOE—Bkfst

Gang.
KNX—Morning Stars.
KGER—Aubrey Lee.
KFOX—Dr. Harrod,

Music.
7:30 A. M.

KFI—Platter Party.
KMPC—Up Swing.
KECA—News.
KNX—Bob Garred.

KFOX—Bible Hour.

TOMORROW (Friday), FEBRUARY 3
7:45 A.M.

KFI—Sam Hayes.
KMPC—Morning

Time.
KHJ—New?
KECA—Zeke Man-

ners.
:NX—Fred Beck.

KGER—W. B. Record
KVOE—Hot Cake

Club
8 A. M..

KLAC—News, Stocks
KFI—Coffee Time.
KMPC—Norm.

Nesbitt
KECA—Break, Club
KHJ—John Bosman.
KFWB—Clete

Roberts.
KNX—Clubtime.
KFAC—Church.
KGER—Mizpah.
KFOX—All Nations

Bible Society.
KTED—Melodies.

8:15 A. M.
KFI—Marriage lor 2.
KLAC—Haynes.
KMPC—Markets,

Sports.
KHJ, KNX—News.
KVOE—Bob Poole.
KFWB—Instrumen-

tal.
KFOX—Prison Mis-

sionary Program.
8:30 A. M.

KFI—Jack Berch.
KMPC—Song for

You. '
KH-T, KVOE—Bible

Institute.
KNX—Grand Slam.
KGER—R. R

Hammond.
KFOX—Words of

Life.
8:45 A. M.

KFI—Meyers Goes

to Market
KMPC, KTED—

News.
KHJ—Music.
KFWB—Science of

Mind.
KLAC—Racing News
KNX—Rosemary.

Church Program
for Youngsters
Starts Friday !

'Children's Church," a nonde-
nominational religious program, j
will be seen for the first time ]
Friday at 6:30 p. m. on KTTV,
Channel 11.

Using a traditional church set-
ting, the program features a 24-
voice choir of' youngsters from

18 to 18 years of age, under the
direction of Miss Vivian Long.
The vested choir will be heard
| in familiar hymns and standard
sacred music, as well as provid-
ing, background effects for re-
ligious tableaus.

Vincent Pelletier will enact the
children's minister,' reading the
scripture lesson, urging a back-to-
Sunday School movement, and
conducting a Bible quiz for mem-
bers of the choir.

A weekly feature will be a
short dramatization of a scene
from the Bible. These damatiza-
tions will be introduced as stories
told by an ageless man. Brother
Paul, played by John Frank, to
the children who cluster about
him. The first dramatization will
be that of the 23rd Psalm and
how it came to be written.

"The Lord's Prayer" will be
sung by the choir on the initial
program^ and in other numbers
Sandy Logan and Jon Hentze will
be heard as soloists. Toni Wheat-
ley will read the 121st Psalm,
and Eddie Griggs, Robert Red-
wood, Ginger Smith and Camellia
Branham will be seen in the Bible
dramatization.

Treasury.
9 A. M.

KLAC—News, Music.
KFI—News, Ladies'

Day.
KMPC—Band Box
KHJ, KVOE—Kate

Smith.
KFWB—Strollin'

Tom.
KECA—Ladies Be

Seated.
KNX—Wendy

KGE^-Lutheran Hr OH Video Sunday
: A dramatization of H e n r y
j James' novel, 'The Marriages,1'

Henry James Story

KFOX—Religious.
KTED—Homemaker

Harmonies.
9:15 A. M.

starring Henry Daniel], Margarei
• Phillips and Carol Goodner, will
be presented on "Television Play

KLAC— Sing Worries iholfse" Sundav, Channel 4, at "9
Away.

KFOX—Music.
KNX—Aunt Jenny.
KVOE—Lyrics for

Ladies.
9:30 A. M.

KMPC—Chef Milani
KECA—Quick as a

Flash.
KHJ—Women Are

Wonderful
KNX—Helen Trent
KFWB—Bob Garrick.
KGER—Religious.
KFOX—Full Gospel
KVOE—Tell

Neighbor.
9:45 A. M.

KFI—Around Town.
KNX—Gal Sunday.

ip mWalton- ' Others in the cast are Chester
iStratton, Diana Marlowe, Sandra
Ann Wigginton and Sally Gracie

CALL 8-8602
f«r • C»mfl*r»

SIZZLING HOT

CHICKEN DINNER
DILIVtllD TO YOU
WITHIN AN HOUI

$2.95
$2.70

S.

Pict U.o .V
Our Kitchtn
Th* Sizzling Chicken

Tilt Aaron Sehntti stores art op**
Monday ana! Friday tvtninqs.
tiy on ttrms if you preftr.

LOWEST PRICE EVER FOR

RCA EYE-WITNESS TELEVISION

Eye-witness

picture synchronizer.

Automatic multi-channel

station selector.

Golden throat

tone system.

Phono-Jack to

plug in RCA "45"

automatic record

changer.

16995

Here's the answer to your question:

"Which Set Shall I Buy?"

RCA Bring* You Tremendous Value in
The T-100, Backed by Firtt-clasi Engineering
Plui a Smartly Strlfd Cabinet You'll Bf Proud to Own.'
Other RCA Stu, Too! Sre Thorn!

•FOR OVER A QUARTER CENTURY•

COMPLETE HOME FURNISHINGS*

The UPTOWN Store . . . . 4321 Atlantic Ave.
The Downtown Store 317 American Ave.


